
Day 1 

Depart North America 

Depart North America for your flight to Australia. 

 

 

Day 2 

En Route to Australia - Cross InternaƟonal Dateline 

A day will be lost to travel as you approach Australia. 

 

 

Day 3 

Arrive Australia 

AŌer clearing Australian Customs and ImmgraƟon formaliƟes you are transfered to the Gold Coast and 
your resort in Surfers Paradise. 

The balance of the day is at leisure to relax and explore this oceanside resort at your own pace. 

DuraƟon 2 Nights 

AccommodaƟon  

Mantra Legends Surfers Paradise 

 

 

Day 4 

Day at Leisure 

Today is totally free and at leisure. You can take advantage of any opƟonal acƟviƟes available or simply 
relax. 

 

 

Day 5 

Gold Coast City Hotels to Holt Street Wharf 

DuraƟon 3 Hours 



Holt Street Wharf to Tangalooma Island Resort 

DuraƟon 75 Minutes 

Tangalooma Island Resort 

Tangalooma Island Resort is located on Moreton Island and is surrounded by crystal clear water and set 
amongst the beauty of Queensland's Moreton Bay. The resort is a perfect desƟnaƟon for guests seeking 
a unique adventure, educaƟonal or nature based experience. The star aƩracƟon at the resort is the 
unique acƟvity of hand feeding a pod of wild boƩlenose dolphins. There are five beach front 
accommodaƟon styles, each set amidst luscious landscaped gardens and natural bush land. 

Meal Plan Room Only 

DuraƟon 2 Nights 

AccommodaƟon  

Tangalooma Island Resort 

 

 

Day 6 

Day at Leisure 

Today is totally free and at leisure. You can take advantage of any opƟonal acƟviƟes available or simply 
relax. 

 

 

Day 7 

Tangalooma Island Resort to Holt Street Wharf 

DuraƟon 75 Minutes 

Holt Street Wharf to Brisbane Hotel 

DuraƟon 45 Minutes 

Adina Apartment Hotel Anzac Square 

Ideally located in Anzac Square building, the Adina Apartment Hotel Anzac Square offers the best of 'old 
world charm' and modern faciliƟes. It is simply a great locaƟon from which to access various nearby 
landmarks. The hotel provides 130 hotel rooms, as well as 1 and 2 bedroom apartments. It is across the 
street from the Central Railway StaƟon and is minutes away from the Queen St. Mall and the Treasury 
Casino. 

Meal Plan Room Only 



DuraƟon 2 Nights 

AccommodaƟon  

Adina Apartment Hotel Anzac Square 

 

 

Day 8 

Day at Leisure 

Today is totally free and at leisure. You can take advantage of any opƟonal acƟviƟes available or simply 
relax. 

 

 

Day 9 

Brisbane Hotel to Noosa Hotel 

DuraƟon 1 Hour 

Seahaven Noosa Resort 

Experience the ulƟmate beach holiday at Seahaven Noosa Resort, located with direct access to Noosa 
Main Beach and the world famous HasƟngs Street with renowned restaurants, cafes and bouƟque 
shopping. You can enjoy the very best of Noosa right at your front door. 

Meal Plan Room Only 

DuraƟon 2 Nights 

AccommodaƟon  

Seahaven Noosa Resort 

 

 

Day 10 

Day at Leisure 

Today is totally free and at leisure. You can take advantage of any opƟonal acƟviƟes available or simply 
relax. 

 

 



Day 11 

Sunshine Coast Hotel (Peregian beach to Noosa) to Brisbane Airport 

DuraƟon 2 Hours 

Cairns DomesƟc Airport to Port Douglas 

DuraƟon 1 Hour 

The Meridian at Port Douglas 

Meridian Port Douglas is a contemporary bouƟque resort that offers 33 luxury 4 star apartments in a 
selecƟon of self catering Studios and One Bedroom Apartments. Meridian is ideal for couples requiring a 
peaceful and relaxing getaway and is suitable only for mature guests over 16 years of age. 

The resorts central feature is the heated lagoon style pool with a sundeck, large BBQ area all set amongst 
lush tropical gardens. Meridian is a true haven for adults only looking for an escape, in the heart of 
vibrant Port Douglas. Rooms are not serviced daily (daily housekeeping for an addiƟonal fee is available). 

Meal Plan Room Only - Weekly Service 

DuraƟon 3 Nights 

AccommodaƟon  

The Meridian at Port Douglas 

 

 

Day 12 

Quicksilver Cruises Outer Barrier Reef Cruise ex Wharf 

For an experience of a lifeƟme, Quicksilver's wave-piercing catamarans and friendly crew will take you to 
a reef at the very edge of Australia's ConƟnental Shelf, to an underwater world that is a dazzling 
kaleidoscope of colour and brilliance. 

Agincourt Reef is a magnificent ribbon reef, where you can experience firsthand the magic that is the 
Great Barrier Reef. Choose to dive, snorkel, or stay dry and explore the stunning reef from the comfort of 
a semi-sub, only one-metre underwater. Watch the fish feeding from a unique underwater viewing 
plaƞorm and underwater observatory, or fly in a helicopter over the reef (at an extra cost). Whichever 
way you choose; you'll bring home a lifeƟme of memories from this living natural wonder. 

DuraƟon 7 Hours 

 

 

 



Day 13 

Day at Leisure 

Today is totally free and at leisure. You can take advantage of any opƟonal acƟviƟes available or simply 
relax. 

 

 

Day 14 

Depart Australia 

This morning, transfer to the Cairns InternaƟonal Airport for your onward flight. Of course if you want to 
stay longer your Goway DesƟnaƟon Specialist can customize the perfect iƟnerary for you. 


