
Day 1: Nairobi 

Arrive Nairobi Jomo Kenyatta International Airport on scheduled flight (booked by Africa Answers) (details to be 
advised).  After clearing Immigration and customs, you will be met by a representative and assisted with retrieving 
your luggage and assisted to your private transfer to your Nairobi accommodation, Tamarind Tree Hotel. Rest of 
day at leisure.  

Accommodations: Tamarind Tree Hotel (Deluxe) 

 

Day 2: Nairobi - Amboseli 

After an early breakfast, transfer to Nairobi Wilson Airport for your scheduled flight to Amboseli National Park. The 
flight departs Nairobi at 0730 AM and arrives into Amboseli at 0830 AM.  

Amboseli National Park spans approximately 151 square miles and is nestled at the base of Mount Kilimanjaro, 
Africa's tallest peak. Known for its sweeping savannah plains and iconic views of the majestic mountain, the park 
boasts a rich diversity of wildlife, including large herds of elephants, lions, giraffes, zebras, and wildebeests. 
Visitors to Amboseli can enjoy unparalleled opportunities for wildlife observation, birdwatching, and photography 
amidst the stunning backdrop of Kilimanjaro's snow-capped summit. With its awe-inspiring landscapes and 
abundant wildlife, Amboseli National Park offers an unforgettable experience that captures the grandeur and 
beauty of the African wilderness. 

Upon arrival, you will be met by your guide and depart on your first game drive. At the conclusion of your game 
drive, you will arrive at your accommodation, Tawi Cottages where you have time to check in, enjoy lunch and 
relax.  

Tawi Lodge is located on a private conservancy of 6,000 acres just five minutes from Kimana Gate, the eastern 
entrance to Amboseli National Park, at the foot of Mount Kilimanjaro. Tawi Lodge offers stylish accommodation 
and also contributes in the promotion of a harmonious development for the wildlife and the Maasai people along 
the corridor between Amboseli and the Chyulu Hills.  

Around 4pm, there will be an afternoon game drive, returning to lodge as the sun sets.  (B,L,D) 

Accommodations: Tawi Lodge (Luxury) 

 

Day 3: Amboseli 

Enjoy morning and afternoon game viewing in the park with possible clear views of the highest mountain in Africa, 
Mt Kilimanjaro. This is a perfect backdrop to herds of elephant, Cape buffalo, giraffe and the many species of 
plains game that are found here. (B,L,D) 

Accommodations: Tawi Lodge (Luxury) 

 

Day 4: Samburu 

Following an early breakfast, enjoy morning game viewing enroute Amboseli Airstrip. Depart on the scheduled 
flights via Nairobi departing 0810 AM arriving Samburu at 1120 AM.   Samburu National Park covers approximately 
64 square miles of breathtaking wilderness in northern Kenya. Characterized by rugged terrain and the winding 



Ewaso Ng'iro River, this park is renowned for its unique wildlife and stunning landscapes. Visitors can encounter 
rare species such as Grevy's zebras, reticulated giraffes, Somali ostriches, and Beisa oryx against the backdrop of 
rocky outcrops and vast savannah plains. Guided game drives offer opportunities for unforgettable wildlife 
sightings, while cultural interactions with the local Samburu people provide insights into traditional ways of life.  

Upon arrival, you will be met by your guide and embark on a game drive that concludes at your accommodation 
for the following two nights, Saruni Samburu. 

Saruni Samburu commands some of the best views in Kenya. It’s a much-loved design lodge perched on top of a 
spectacular viewpoint, its villas and its swimming pools overlook waterholes where the famous Samburu elephant, 
leopard, reticulated giraffe and Grevy zebra gather to drink.  

In the late afternoon, take an afternoon game drive in the park returning to camp as the sun sets. (B,L,D)  

Accommodations: Saruni Samburu (Luxury) 

 

Day 5: Samburu 

Enjoy morning and afternoon game drives, or the varied activities offered by the lodge. (B,L,D) 

Accommodations: Saruni Samburu (Luxury) 

 

Day 6: Masai Mara 

After breakfast transfer to Samburu airstrip for the scheduled flight to Masai Mara’s Mara North Airstrip departing 
0905 AM arriving 1100 AM. On arrival, you are met by your guide and transferred to your accommodation, Saruni 
Mara, for lunch.   

Saruni Mara is an intimate lodge located in the game rich and exclusive Mara North Conservancy. With only six 
spectacular cottages, Saruni offers a new concept of African safari: a real African adventure lived in harmony with 
the Maasai warriors coupled with high standards of style and comfort.  

Following lunch and an afternoon siesta, enjoy an afternoon game drive in Mara North Conservancy and you 
return to the lodge for sundowners and dinner around sunset.  (B,L,D)  

Accommodations: Saruni Mara (Luxury) 

 

Day 7: Masai Mara 

Your hosts will help you choose from a host of included activities - day and night game drives, guided bush walks, 
bush meals and sundowners.  

Accommodations: Saruni Mara (Luxury) 

 

 

 

 



Day 8: Masai Mara – Nairobi - Depart 

Following an early morning safari activity and breakfast, you will transfer to Mara North Airstrip for your scheduled 
flight to Nairobi Wilson Airport departing 1100 AM arriving 1220 PM.  On arrival at Wilson Airport, you will 
transfer to Nairobi’s Jomo Kenyatta International Airport.  (B) 


